
 
 

Emperor Haile Sellassie The First Lives! 
 
 
There is only One Almighty, HAILE SELLASSIE I, who has been called upon by many names, in many 
tongues, in many ages. There is only One Almighty I. 
 
There is only One Life, the everliving life of HAILE SELLASSIE I All of creation is the Life of the Almighty 
I in action. There is only One Life. 
 
There is only One Man, the everliving Black man, image and likeness of the Almighty I. There is only 
One Man. 
 
There is only One Truth, whose record is in the scrolls of life in the tabernacle of Mount Zion. There is 
only One Truth. 
 
There is only One Love, the perfect love of the Everliving I, HAILE SELLASSIE I, which is the law of 
everliving life. There is only One Love. 
 
Africa is the original home of the generation of Noah and thus, the root of all mankind. All Africans are 
of One Empire. 
 
Death is the habitation of the anti~Christ/Satan/Lucifer. The white man is the word of death made 
flesh and generated through a wolf. No white man may live forever. By order of the Supreme 
Commander, DEATH TO THE ENEMIES OF THE AFRICAN RACE! 
 
“King Alpha and Queen Omega said they are our parents and the keeper of the Tree of Life, he and his 
wife are not any family at all to Adam and Eve and Abraham and Isaac and the Anglo Saxon slave 
owners... and Royal leper Adam and Eve and Abraham and Anglo Saxon are all white people, if you 
please.” * 
 
The Bahtawi / Nazarene separates from all dead and is anointed of the Everliving I: “For ghosts only 
visit the lepers home”.* Beloved brethren and sistren, forsake the flesh of the dead, for it is not a 
meat fit for the everliving banquet of Black Supremacy. Neither sip no wine nor alcohol nor smoke 
tobacco; for the temple of the Everliving I welcomes not cancer, ulcer, asthma, heart attack and all 
servants of death. FIRE! Beloved brethren and sistren, forsake all fornication: “Black must not marry 
white nor white black, race enmity”.* Spill not, in no wise, your seed in vain, lest the Book of Life be 
defiled. (see 1JOHN:Ch.3,vs.9) 
 
The harvest is near, the reapers are few and judgement is sure. Idren and sistren, keep a pure heart 
and strong faith; for He will not forsake even one true faithful. I and I seek His Ivine face, brighter than 
the Sun, circled with Rainbow glory. I and I search the Word of His Invincible Majesty, for those who 
love wise counsel and Iverstanding shall possess Truth. I and I serve Ethiopia with true Love, for the 
gates of Zion are surely open. I and I seek within, brethren and sistren, for His Love conquers all. 
 
I and I seek H.LM. with Ises, beloved Idren, Ises to His Iverliving Majesty HAILE SELLASSIE I! THE 
SUPREME COMMANDER! RAS TAFARI! 
 
* All quotes from THE PROMISE KEY by Leonard Percival Howell a.k.a. “Gong Guru Maragh” 
 
 

(This document was first published by the Nyahbinghi order in NYC on occasion of HIM Centenary) 
 


